
ATTACHMENT D 

Pricing: Charter Services 

FIRM NAME: Coastal Charter Service Corp. 

Hourly/Mileage Rates 16-Passenger Bus* 24-Passenger Bus* 36-Passenger Bus* 55-Passenger Bus* 
4 hours NO BID NO BID NO BID $850.00 
6 hours NO BID NO BID NO BID $950.00 
8 hours NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,200.00 
12 hours NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,800.00 
Overnight NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,600.00 
Minimum Charge NO BID NO BID NO BID 4 hours - $850.00 
(hour or dollar) 
Rate/Mile NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A 

*If the bus sizes above cannot be quoted due to specific capacities, state the closest available size in your fleet. 

Flat Rate 16-Passenger Bus* 24-Passenger Bus* 36-Passenger Bus* 55-Passenger Bus* 
To and From 

Old Westbury Campus 
LaGuardia NO BID NO BID NO BID $950.00 
JFK NO BID NO BID NO BID $950.00 
Newark NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,100.00 
L.I. MacArthur NO BID NO BID NO BID $795.00 

Manhattan Campus 
LaGuardia NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,050.00 
JFK NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,050.00 
Newark NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,250.00 
LI. MacArthur NO BID NO BID NO BID $895.00 

*If the bus sizes above cannot be quoted due to specific capacities, state the closest available size in your fleet. 

Flat Rate 
I 

16-Passenger Bus* I 24-Passenger Bus* I 36-Passenger Bus* 
I 

55-Passenger Bus* 
To and From 

Old Westbury to Manhattan OR Manhattan to Old Westbury 
I NO BID I NO BID I NO BID I $850.00 

Old Westbury to Central Islip OR Central Islip to Old Westbury 
I NO BID I NO BID I NO BID I $795.00 

Manhattan to Central Islip OR Central Islip to Manhattan 
I NO BID I NO BID I NO BID I $850.00 

*If the bus sizes above cannot be quoted due to specific capacities, state the closest available size in your fleet. 
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COASTAL CHARTER 

Sarah Paulos – Sales Representative
sales@northforkexpress.com or 
sarah@northforkexpress.com
631.588.7433



Pricing: Charter Services 

(Continued) 

PRICING: Per ATTACHMENT D Sample Trips - quote pricing per each vehicle/bus 

SCHOOL OF MANAGEMENT 
Mt. Peter Ski Trip (Day Trip) $1,310.00 
Philadelphia (Day Trip) $1,465.00 
Brotherhood Winery - Cosimos Restaurant - Woodbury Commons $1,310.00 
West Point Military Academy Tour (Day Trip) $1,290.00 
JFK Airport Pickup (Per Trip)- Size of vehicle varies; quote as follow: 

• 16-Passenger NO BID 

• 24-Passenger NO BID 

• 36-Passenger NO BID 

• 55-Passenger $1,050.00 

STUDENT AFFAIRS (ALUMNI RELATIONS) 
MetLife Stadium (Day Trip) - Size of vehicle varies; quote as follows: 

• 16-Passenger NO BID 

• 24-Passenger NO BID 

• 36-Passenger NO BID 

• 55-Passenger $1,050.00 

STUDENT AFFAIRS (ORL and CAMPUS LIFE) 
SUMMER Orientation: OW campus to SUNY OW residence halls one day; SUNY OW $1,000.00 per bus 
to OW campus the next day (8 buses needed for this event) 
SUMMER International Orientation: Buses from OW campus and SUNY OW to $1,000.00 per bus 
Hicksville Mall/Target (3 buses needed for this event) - all day "Shuttle" 
FALL/SPRING Semesters (Same-day trips; 1 to 2 buses required): 

• Round trip from OW campus to/from Broadway $1,200.00 

• Round trip from OW campus to/from Barclays Center $1,200.00 
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Pricing: Charter Services 
ATHLETICS TEAM TRAVEL 

Price (include fuel costs, tolls and parking) *NOTE: 
NYIT covers the cost of hotel room for the driver(s) 

Destination 
1-night rate 

2-night rate 3-night rate 4-night rate 
Adelphi University; Garden City, NY $ 1,830.00 $3,310.00 $4,790.00 $ 6,265.00 
Amherst. NY 1st stop; Rochester, NY 2nd Stop $ 3,850.00 $ 5,330.00 $ 6,810.00 $ 8,290.00 
Bentley University; Waltham, MA $3,250.00 $4,730.00 $6,210.00 $ 7,690.00 
Coppin State; Baltimore, MD $3,260.00 $ 4,740.00 $6,220.00 $ 7,700.00 
Daemen College; Amherst, NY $3,850.00 $ 5,330.00 $6,810.00 $ 8,290.00 
Georgetown University; Washington DC $3,395.00 $ 4,870.00 $6,350.00 $ 7,830.00 
Georgian Court University; Lakewood, NJ $ 2,865.00 $ 4,345.00 $5,825.00 $ 7,305.00 
Lehigh University; Bethlehem, PA $ 2,910.00 $4,390.00 $5,865.00 $ 7,345.00 
LIU Post; Brookville, NY $1,605.00 $3,085.00 $4,565.00 $ 6,045.00 
Manhattan College; Riverdale, NY $1,810.00 $3,290.00 $4,770.00 $ 6,250.00 
Mercy College; Dobbs Ferry, NY $1,850.00 $ 3,330.00 $4,805.00 $ 6,285.00 
Molloy College; Rockville Centre, NY $1,670.00 $ 3,150.00 $4,630.00 $ 6,110.00 
Naval Academy, Annapolis, MD $3,325.00 $4,805.00 $ 6,285.00 $ 7,765.00 
Northeastern University; Boston, MA $ 3,265.00 $4,745.00 $ 6,225.00 $ 7,705.00 
Pace University; Plesantville, NY $1,945.00 $3,425.00 $4,905.00 $ 6,385.00 
Philadelphia University; Philadelphia, PA $2,975.00 $ 4,455.00 $5,935.00 $ 7,415.00 
Rindge, NH 1st stop; Easton, MA 2nd stop $ 3,850.00 $5,330.00 $ 6,810.00 $ 8,290.00 
Roberts Wesleyan; Rochester, NY $3,710.00 $ 5,190.00 $ 6,670.00 $ 8,145.00 
Rochester, NY 1st stop; Amherst, NY 2nd Stop $3,850.00 $ 5,330.00 $6,810.00 $ 8,290.00 
RPI; Troy, NY $ 3,085.00 $4,565.00 $ 6,045.00 $ 7,525.00 
Saint Michael's College; Colchester, VT $3,690.00 $ 5,170.00 $ 6,650.00 $ 8,130.00 
Siena College; Loudonville, NY $3,080.00 $ 4,560.00 $ 6,040.00 $ 7,520.00 
Southern Connecticut University; New Haven, CT $ 2,800.00 $ 4,280.00 $ 5,760.00 $ 7,235.00 
Southern New Hampshire University, Hooksett, NH $3,395.00 $ 4,870.00 $ 6,350.00 $ 7,830.00 
Stonehill College; North Easton, MA $ 3,225.00 $4,705.00 $ 6,185.00 $ 7,665.00 
University at Albany; Albany, NY $3,060.00 $4,540.00 $ 6,015.00 $ 7,495.00 
University of District of Columbia; Washington DC $3,365.00 $4,845.00 $ 6,325.00 $ 7,805.00 
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